
Water Treatment Plant

Village of Piketon

Project No. 211118

Bid Opening Date:  April 12, 2023

BID SUMMARY - CONTRACT A - WATER TREATMENT PLANT

BIDDER CONTRACT A

1 WAICG	 $8,520,000.00

2 Orders Construction Company, Inc. $12,133,000.00

 

Opinion of Probable Construction Cost:             $7,750,000.00



Water Treatment Plant

Village of Piketon

Project No. 211118

Bid Opening Date:  April 12, 2023

BID TABULATION

WAICG	 Orders Construction Company, Inc.

Ref 

No.
Description - Water Treatment Plant Quan. Unit

Unit Price Labor

Unit Price 

Material Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Labor

Unit Price 

Material Total Unit Price Item Total

1 New Water Treatment Plant 1 LS $4,032,500.00 $4,032,500.00 $8,065,000.00 $8,065,000.00 $2,500,000.00 $9,178,000.00 $11,678,000.00 $11,678,000.00

Allowances $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

A-1 Payment to AEP for Incoming Power Service 1 LS ------------- ------------- $50,000.00 $50,000.00 ------------- ------------- $50,000.00 $50,000.00

A-2 Payment to Pike Gas for Natural Gas Service 1 LS ------------- ------------- $50,000.00 $50,000.00 ------------- ------------- $50,000.00 $50,000.00

A-3 System Integration 1 LS ------------- ------------- $225,000.00 $225,000.00 ------------- ------------- $225,000.00 $225,000.00

A-4 Project Sign 1 LS ------------- ------------- $5,000.00 $5,000.00 ------------- ------------- $5,000.00 $5,000.00

A-5 HVAC Heating System & Associated Electrical Work in the Process Area 1 LS ------------- ------------- $125,000.00 $125,000.00 ------------- ------------- $125,000.00 $125,000.00

TOTAL BASE BID $8,520,000.00 $12,133,000.00

Description - Alternates

Alt-1a Modifications to the existing WTP 1 LS $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $15,000.00 $55,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00

Alt-1b Raw Water Main from Existing WTP to New WTP 3,253 LF $32.48 $97.44 $129.92 $422,629.76 $30.00 $100.00 $130.00 $422,890.00

Alt-2 Concrete Clearwell in lieu of Glass Lined Steel 1 add / deduct $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 No Bid

Alt-3 Welded Steel Clearwell in lieu of Glass Lined Steel 1 add / deduct $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 No Bid

Alt-4a Dual Parallel Underdrain for Gravity Filters (stainless steel) 1 add / deduct $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 No Bid

Alt-4b Dual Parallel Underdrain for Gravity Filters (plastic) 1 add / deduct $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 No Bid


