
NORTH PARK CDF SEDIMENT & MATERIALS RECYCLING FACILITY

OWNER: Kurtz Bros., Inc.

PROJECT NO.:  210513

BID OPENING DATE:  May 6, 2022  

BIDDING SUMMARY  

BIDDER

BASE BID -  

Phase 1 & 2 

Total INFORMAL TOTAL Difference

BASE BID plus 

ALTERNATE A

BASE BID plus 

ALTERNATE 

A&B

1 HAYNES CONSTGRUCTION $5,479,904.00 $5,479,904.00 $0.00 $6,211,154.00 $6,211,154.00
see note 1

2 GREAT LAKES CONSTRUCTION CO. $5,323,162.80 $5,579,058.15 $255,895.35 $30,895.35 $6,313,162.80
see notes 2&3

$17,654,162.80

3 ANTHONY ALLE\GA CEMENT CONTRACTOR, INC. $6,302,236.91 $6,302,077.16 ($159.75) $8,430,736.91 $12,429,236.91

4 INDEPENDENCE EXCAVATION, INC. $7,444,147.50 $7,444,147.50 $0.00 $8,344,147.50 $17,831,647.50

5

6

7

     

Opinion of Probable Construction Cost:   $6,300,000.00

Errors in contractor calculations in Bold

1 Haynes Consruction "NO BID" for Alternate B is considered acceptable as the Offsite Borrow & Export Item was added as alternate to utilizing on-site borrow material.

2

3

ITEM TYPO ON BID FORM $25,0000.00. Revised number is $25,000.00 ( used by all contractors except Great Lakes )

GLC had page with stipulations of included and not included items. Many Items were to have been included in costs.



NORTH PARK CDF SEDIMENT & MATERIALS RECYCLING FACILITY

Kurtz Bros., Inc.
Bid Opening: April _____, 2022

HAYNES CONSTGRUCTION GREAT LAKES CONSTRUCTION CO. ANTHONY ALLE\GA CEMENT CONTRACTOR, INC. INDEPENDENCE EXCAVATION, INC.

Item 

No.

Description Quan. Unit Unit Price 

Labor

Unit Price 

Material

Total Unit 

Price Item Total

Unit Price 

Labor

Unit Price 

Material Total Unit Price Item Total Total Unit Price Item Total

Unit Price 

Labor

Unit Price 

Material Total Unit Price Item Total

PHASE 1

DAM CONSTRUCTION

1 (201) CLEARING AND GRUBBING, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 12,500.00 0.00 12,500.00 12,500.00 48,500.00 0.00 48,500.00 48,500.00 18,000.00 0.00 18,000.00 18,000.00 50,000.00 0.00 50,000.00 50,000.00

2 (203) EXCAVATION INCLUDING EMBANKMENT CONSTRUCTION, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 500,000.00 0.00 500,000.00 500,000.00 658,000.00 0.00 658,000.00 658,000.00 986,000.00 25,413.39 1,011,413.39 1,011,413.39 1,000,000.00 100,000.00 1,100,000.00 1,100,000.00

3 GUARDRAIL REMOVAL & REPLACE 100 LF 23.00 41.00 64.00 6,400.00 29.00 29.00 58.00 5,800.00 41.95 27.95 69.90 6,990.00 20.00 38.00 58.00 5,800.00

4 (SPC) GRAVEL ACCESS DRIVE, AS PER PLAN 635 SY 14.00 83.00 97.00 61,595.00 11.50 11.50 23.00 14,605.00 25.50 16.83 42.33 26,879.55 30.00 70.00 100.00 63,500.00

5 (601) ROCK CHANNEL PROTECTION, TYPE D, WITH FILETR FABRIC, AS PER PLAN  (SPILLWAYS, 12 INCHES) 488 CY 18.00 87.00 105.00 51,240.00 39.00 39.00 78.00 38,064.00 46.44 30.95 77.39 37,766.32 40.00 125.00 165.00 80,520.00

6 (602) HEADWALL 1 EA 4,000.00 6,200.00 10,200.00 10,200.00 290.00 290.00 580.00 580.00 2,002.00 1,334.68 3,336.68 3,336.68 1,500.00 500.00 2,000.00 2,000.00

7 (601) ROCK CHANNEL PROTECTION, TYPE C, WITH FILTER FABRIC, AS PER PLAN  (30 INCHES) 18 CY 100.00 100.00 200.00 3,600.00 51.50 51.50 103.00 1,854.00 81.61 54.41 136.02 2,448.36 25.00 125.00 150.00 2,700.00

8 (611) UNDERDRAIN HEADWALLS (ODOT STANDARD) 3 EA 500.00 400.00 900.00 2,700.00 210.00 210.00 420.00 1,260.00 418.09 278.73 696.82 2,090.46 600.00 150.00 750.00 2,250.00

9 (605) 6 INCH DEEP PIPE UNDERDRAIN, AS PER  PLAN 450 LF 108.00 220.00 328.00 147,600.00 10.00 10.00 20.00 9,000.00 123.29 82.19 205.48 92,466.00 65.00 20.00 85.00 38,250.00

10 (611) 6" CONDUIT, TYPE B, AS PER PLAN 100 LF 40.00 9.00 49.00 4,900.00 6.65 6.65 13.30 1,330.00 52.16 34.78 86.94 8,694.00 25.00 5.00 30.00 3,000.00

11 (611) 30"  IPS HDPE DR 11, AS PER PLAN 200 LF 101.00 100.00 201.00 40,200.00 27.00 27.00 54.00 10,800.00 72.08 48.06 120.14 24,028.00 120.00 55.00 175.00 35,000.00

12 (511) CLASS QC1 CONCRETE, FOOTING (PIPE CRADLE), AS PER PLAN 95 CY 85.00 430.00 515.00 48,925.00 210.00 210.00 420.00 39,900.00 341.18 227.46 568.64 54,020.80 210.00 240.00 450.00 42,750.00

13 (611) STORM OUTLET CONTROL STRUCTURE, AS PER PLAN 1 EA 21,000.00 85,000.00 106,000.00 106,000.00 43,500.00 43,500.00 87,000.00 87,000.00 27,929.65 111,719.61 139,649.26 139,649.26 20,000.00 130,000.00 150,000.00 150,000.00

14 (SPC) LAWN RESTORATION INCL. LINEAL GRADING & TOPSOIL, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 16,000.00 55,000.00 71,000.00 71,000.00 47,500.00 47,500.00 95,000.00 95,000.00 71,020.77 47,347.18 118,367.95 118,367.95 60,000.00 35,000.00 95,000.00 95,000.00

15 (671) EROSION CONTROL MAT, TYPE C 30,524 SY 1.50 1.50 3.00 91,572.00 0.85 0.85 1.70 51,890.80 1.72 1.16 2.88 87,909.12 1.00 0.50 1.50 45,786.00

16 (SPC) TEMPORARY EROSION CONTROL, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 8,500.00 22,500.00 31,000.00 31,000.00 11,500.00 11,500.00 23,000.00 23,000.00 34,199.71 22,799.81 56,999.52 56,999.52 45,000.00 45,000.00 90,000.00 90,000.00

SITE PREP. & 2 ft CLAY CAP

17 (201) CLEARING AND GRUBBING, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 12,400.00 0.00 12,400.00 12,400.00 31,000.00 0.00 31,000.00 31,000.00 36,000.00 0.00 36,000.00 36,000.00 40,000.00 0.00 40,000.00 40,000.00

18 (203) EXCAVATION INCLUDING EMBANKMENT CONSTRUCTION, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 501,000.00 0.00 501,000.00 501,000.00 634,000.00 0.00 634,000.00 634,000.00 426,908.75 0.00 426,908.75 426,908.75 400,000.00 100,000.00 500,000.00 500,000.00

19 (SPC) LAWN RESTORATION INCL. LINEAL GRADING & TOPSOIL, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 24,000.00 55,000.00 79,000.00 79,000.00 104,500.00 104,500.00 209,000.00 209,000.00 57,730.07 38,486.71 96,216.78 96,216.78 5,000.00 5,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00

20 (203) EXCAVATION OF UNSUITABLE MATERIAL, AS PER PLAN 6,000 CY 18.00 0.00 18.00 108,000.00 12.50 12.50 25.00 150,000.00 33.28 0.00 33.28 199,680.00 8.00 1.00 9.00 54,000.00

21 (SPC) MOBILIZATION 1 LS 24,000.00 200,000.00 224,000.00 224,000.00 200,000.00 0.00 200,000.00 200,000.00 101,437.51 0.00 101,437.51 101,437.51 400,000.00 100,000.00 500,000.00 500,000.00

PHASE 1 SUB-TOTAL 2,113,832.00 2,310,583.80 2,551,142.70 2,551,302.45 2,910,556.00

SLUICEWAY AND

REMAINING SITE CONSTRUCTION

22 (203) EXCAVATION INCLUDING EMBANKMENT CONSTRUCTION, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 425,000.00 0.00 425,000.00 425,000.00 469,000.00 0.00 469,000.00 469,000.00 439,872.43 0.00 439,872.43 439,872.43 900,000.00 100,000.00 1,000,000.00 1,000,000.00

23 (204) GEOTEXTILE FABRIC, AS PER PLAN 20,188 SY 0.75 2.00 2.75 55,517.00 1.41 1.40 2.81 56,728.28 1.45 0.98 2.43 49,056.84 0.25 0.50 0.75 15,141.00

24 (204) GEOGRID 20,188 SY 0.75 6.00 6.75 136,269.00 2.24 2.50 4.74 95,691.12 3.19 2.13 5.32 107,400.16 1.00 3.25 4.25 85,799.00

25 (SPC) GRAVEL ACCESS DRIVE, AS PER PLAN 20,188 SY 4.50 31.00 35.50 716,674.00 11.25 11.25 22.50 454,230.00 20.59 13.73 34.32 692,852.16 10.00 35.00 45.00 908,460.00

26 (601) ROCK CHANNEL PROTECTION, TYPE B WITH FILTER, AS PER PLAN 6,565 CY 10.00 65.00 75.00 492,375.00 40.00 40.00 80.00 525,200.00 50.17 33.44 83.61 548,899.65 20.00 100.00 120.00 787,800.00

27 (601) ROCK CHANNEL PROTECTION, TYPE D WITH FILTER, AS PER PLAN 3,500 CY 10.00 65.00 75.00 262,500.00 36.50 36.50 73.00 255,500.00 43.80 29.21 73.01 255,535.00 20.00 80.00 100.00 350,000.00

28 (602) HEADWALL 3 EA 2,000.00 4,000.00 6,000.00 18,000.00 1,175.00 1,175.00 2,350.00 7,050.00 4,421.20 2,947.48 7,368.68 22,106.04 1,000.00 2,000.00 3,000.00 9,000.00

29 (607) FENCE, CHAIN LINK, VINYL COATED, 6' HEIGHT, AS PER PLAN 2,265 LF 10.00 39.00 49.00 110,985.00 21.56 21.50 43.06 97,530.90 30.82 20.54 51.36 116,330.40 15.00 22.00 37.00 83,805.00

30 (607) GATE, CHAIN LINK, VINYL COATED, DOUBLE, AS PER PLAN 1 EA 650.00 2,900.00 3,550.00 3,550.00 1,555.00 1,555.00 3,110.00 3,110.00 2,304.00 1,536.00 3,840.00 3,840.00 1,000.00 2,770.00 3,770.00 3,770.00

31 (611) 18" CONDUIT, TYPE B, AS PER PLAN 840 LF 29.00 30.00 59.00 49,560.00 61.00 61.00 122.00 102,480.00 45.25 30.16 75.41 63,344.40 40.00 60.00 100.00 84,000.00

32 (611) 24" CONDUIT, TYPE B, AS PER PLAN 165 LF 50.00 65.00 115.00 18,975.00 130.00 130.00 260.00 42,900.00 193.61 129.08 322.69 53,243.85 100.00 100.00 200.00 33,000.00

33 (611) 30 INCH STEEL CASING, AS PER PLAN 158 LF 26.00 180.00 206.00 32,548.00 105.00 105.00 210.00 33,180.00 260.16 173.44 433.60 68,508.80 50.00 200.00 250.00 39,500.00

34 (611) STORM OUTLET CONTROL STRUCTURE, AS PER PLAN 3 EA 28,000.00 65,000.00 93,000.00 279,000.00 26,000.00 70,000.00 96,000.00 288,000.00 18,443.17 73,772.67 92,215.84 276,647.52 10,000.00 65,000.00 75,000.00 225,000.00

35 (611) CONDUIT, MISC.: 14 INCH ID, 16 INCH OD, DR 17 HDPE WELDED PIPE, AS PER PLAN 2,000 LF 21.00 0.00 21.00 42,000.00 6.95 6.95 13.90 27,800.00 21.12 0.00 21.12 42,240.00 70.00 30.00 100.00 200,000.00

36 (SPC) LAWN RESTORATION INCL. LINEAL GRADING & TOPSOIL, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 20,000.00 45,000.00 65,000.00 65,000.00 90,000.00 90,000.00 180,000.00 180,000.00 93,025.41 62,016.95 155,042.36 155,042.36 40,000.00 35,000.00 75,000.00 75,000.00

37 (671) EROSION CONTROL MAT, TYPE C 14,061 SY 1.50 1.50 3.00 42,183.00 0.85 0.85 1.70 23,903.70 1.73 1.15 2.88 40,495.68 0.50 1.00 1.50 21,091.50

38 (SPC) LANDSCAPING ALLOWANCE, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00



39 (SPC) TEMPORARY EROSION CONTROL, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 8,200.00 18,000.00 26,200.00 26,200.00 8,500.00 8,500.00 17,000.00 17,000.00 60,061.70 40,041.14 100,102.84 100,102.84 7,500.00 7,500.00 15,000.00 15,000.00

39A (SPC) TYPE "F" PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT (STONE), DRIVEWAY, APRON, OR PARKING LOT, AS PER PLAN 825 SY 14.00 26.00 40.00 33,000.00 13.50 13.50 27.00 22,275.00 18.45 12.30 30.75 25,368.75 5.00 20.00 25.00 20,625.00

40 (SPC) ELECTRICAL REPAIRS ALLOWANCE 1 LS 10,000.00 10,000.00 0.00 0.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00

41 (511) CLASS QC1 CONCRETE, FOOTING (SCALE FOUNDATION & PANS), AS PER PLAN 72 CY 300.00 388.00 688.00 49,536.00 285.00 285.00 570.00 41,040.00 338.60 225.73 564.33 40,631.76 150.00 150.00 300.00 21,600.00

42 (SPC) 70 LF TRUCK SCALE & INSTALLATION 1 LS 6,200.00 71,000.00 77,200.00 77,200.00 13,000.00 55,000.00 68,000.00 68,000.00 36,068.45 50,942.25 87,010.70 87,010.70 10,000.00 60,000.00 70,000.00 70,000.00

43 (SPC) MOBILIZATION 1 LS 24,000.00 76,000.00 100,000.00 100,000.00 136,991.25 0.00 136,991.25 136,991.25 210,767.52 0.00 210,767.52 210,767.52 140,000.00 10,000.00 150,000.00 150,000.00

PHASE 2 SUB-TOTAL 3,071,072.00 2,982,474.35 2,726,579.00 3,434,296.86 4,233,591.50

44 (SPC) BONDS AND INSURANCES, AS PER PLAN 1 LS 0.00 45,000.00 45,000.00 45,000.00 36,000.00 0.00 36,000.00 36,000.00 66,637.60 0.00 66,637.60 66,637.60 50,000.00 50,000.00 50,000.00

45 CONTIGENCY/DISCRETIONARY ALLOWANCE 1 LS 250,000.00 250,000.00 250,000.00 250,000.00 250,000.00 250,000.00 250,000.00 250,000.00

PHASE 1 & 2 INFORMAL BID TOTAL 5,479,904.00 5,579,058.15 5,323,162.80 6,302,077.16 6,302,236.91 7,444,147.50

ADD ALTERNATE A

SOIL CONDITIONING

46 (205) LIME STABILIZED EMBANKMENT, AS PER PLAN 225,000 SY 1.75 1.50 3.25 731,250.00 2.20 2.20 4.40 990,000.00 5.68 3.78 9.46 2,128,500.00 1.00 3.00 4.00 900,000.00

INFORMAL ALT TOTAL 731,250.00 990,000.00 2,128,500.00 900,000.00

ADD ALTERNATE B

BORROW & EXPORT

46 (203) BORROW, AS PER PLAN 275,000 CY 0.00 NO BID 21.24 20.00 41.24 11,341,000.00 14.54 0.00 14.54 3,998,500.00 26.50 8.00 34.50 9,487,500.00

(SPEC) EXPORT, AS PER PLAN 75,000 CY 0.00 NO BID 23.19 0.00 23.19 1,739,250.00 16.50 0.00 16.50 1,237,500.00 16.00 0.00 16.00 1,200,000.00

INFORMAL ALT TOTAL NO BID 11,341,000.00 3,998,500.00 9,487,500.00


