BID TABULATION

PROJECT VILLAGE OF JOHNSTOWN ;
NAME:  |ENTERPRISE WATER STORAGE TANK CHRROIECT HO.: 20034507

BID OPG DATE: | Friday, March 5, 2021 . ENGINEER'S OPINION OF COST: $3,000,000

s Phoenix Fabricators and Erectors, LLC Caldwell Tanks, Inc. Landmark Structures |, L.P. Mid Atlantic Storage Systems, Inc.
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E ik n E ; TOTAL UNIT T TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT

- - OTAL UNIT

om LABOR MATERIAL PRICE TOTAL LABOR MATERIAL PRICE TOTAL LABOR MATERIAL PRICE TOTAL LABOR MATERIAL PRICE TOTAL

SITE & MISCELLANEOUS BID ITEMS

1 Mobilization / Demobilization 1 LS |9 50,000.00 | $§ 30,00000| $ 80,000.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 31,500.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 37,900.00 | $ 37,900.00
2 |Clearing and Grubbing 1 LS 15,000.00 7,000.00 22,000.00 22,000.00 12,000.00 6,000.00 18,000.00 18,000.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 6,900.00 3,700.00 10,600.00 10,600.00
3 |Construction Staking 1 LS 4,500.00 500.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 4,000.00 400.00 4,400.00 4,400.00 3,500.00 500.00 4,000.00 4,000.00 4,700.00 500.00 5,200.00 5,200.00
4 |Site Grading 1 LS 17,900.00 100.00 18,000.00 18,000.00 15,000.00 - 15,000.00 15,000.00 24,000.00 1,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 17,700.00 - 17,700.00 17,700.00
5 |12" Waterline (CS00 DR18) 244 LF 50.00 70.00 120.00 29,280.00 35.00 55.00 90.00 21,960.00 25.00 75.00 100.00 24,400.00 41.00 65.00 106.00 25,864.00
6 |12" Waterline (DIP C52) 53 LF 60.00 120.00 180.00 9,540.00 53.00 98.00 151.00 8,003.00 25.00 100.00 125.00 6,625.00 62.00 116.00 178.00 9,434.00
7 |6” Waterline (C900 DR18) 81 LF 40.00 40.00 80.00 6,480.00 33.00 33.00 66.00 5,346.00 20.00 31.00 51.00 4,131.00 39.00 39.00 78.00 6,318.00
8 [Tracer Wire 378 LF 3.00 4.00 7.00 2,646.00 1.64 3.36 5.00 1,890.00 1.00 1.00 2.00 756.00 5.00 1.00 6.00 2,268.00
9 [12" Gate Valve 2 EA 1,000.00 3,000.00 4,000.00 8,000.00 902.00 2,518.00 3,420.00 6,840.00 1,000.00 2,750.00 3,750.00 7,500.00 1,040.00 2,990.00 4,030.00 8,060.00
10 |6" Gate Valve 1 EA 1,000.00 1,500.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 850.00 1,345.00 2,195.00 2,195.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,180.00 3,420.00 5,600.00 5,600.00
11 |6" Hydrant 1 EA 2,500.00 3,000.00 5,500.00 5,500.00 1,930.00 2,822.00 4,752.00 4,752.00 2,000.00 3,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 1,030.00 1,560.00 2,590.00 2,590.00
12 |Site Restoration 1 LS 11,500.00 2,500.00 14,000.00 14,000.00 10,500.00 2,100.00 12,600.00 12,600.00 7,000.00 3,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 12,300.00 2,600.00 14,900.00 14,900.00
13 | Tank Mixer 1 LS 1,000.00 9,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 3,500.00 12,000.00 15,500.00 15,500.00 1,000.00 19,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00 3,800.00 13,200.00 17,000.00 17,000.00
14 |Telemetry 1 EA 10,000.00 88,000.00 98,000.00 98,000.00 10,000.00 88,000.00 98,000.00 98,000.00 5,000.00 65,000.00 70,000.00 70,000.00 19,700.00 96,200.00 115,900.00 115,900.00
15 |Chain Link Fence & Gates 900 LF 25.00 25.00 50.00 45,000.00 10.00 37.00 47.00 42,300.00 20.00 20.00 40.00 36,000.00 30.00 26.00 56.00 50,400.00
16 |ODOT Item 202 — Pavement Removed 1,300 | SY 15.00 5.00 20.00 26,000.00 6.00 12.00 18.00 23,400.00 9.00 1.00 10.00 13,000.00 22.00 - 22.00 28,600.00
17 |ODOT ltem 301 — Asphalt Concrete Base 118 cYy 50.00 150.00 200.00 23,600.00 70.00 125.00 195.00 23,010.00 75.00 125.00 200.00 23,600.00 75.00 155.00 230.00 27,140.00
18 |ODOT ltem 304 — Aggregate Base 220 (24 20.00 40.00 60.00 13,200.00 20.00 38.00 58.00 12,760.00 15.00 36.00 51.00 11,220.00 22.00 47.00 69.00 15,180.00
19 |ODOT Item 407 — Non-Tracking Tack Coat 130 GAL 4.00 2.00 6.00 780.00 4.00 2.00 6.00 780.00 2.00 2.00 4.00 520.00 5.00 3.00 8.00 1,040.00

ODOT Item 441 — Asphalt Concrete

B formediate Course, Type 2 55 | cv 140.00 80.00 220.00 12,100.00 125.00 90.00 215.00 11,825.00 75.00 125.00 200.00 11,000.00 151.00 102.00 253.00 13,915.00
21 8&?;3“.’}’;;411. ;g;f:‘;; CongreteSurface 45 | cy 130.00 110.00 240.00 10,800.00 120.00 110.00 230.00 10,350.00 80.00 160.00 240.00 10,800.00 149,00 122.00 271.00 12,195.00
p) 'T?a?ﬁ? g;’::;s ~Pavementfor Maintaining | 250 | &y 50.00 30.00 80.00 40,000.00 52.00 20.00 72.00 36,000.00 8.00 17.00 25.00 12,500.00 56.00 29.00 85.00 42,500.00
23 12" Type C Conduit (ODOT 707.62) 43 | LF 25.00 65.00 90.00 3,870.00 32.00 48.00 80.00 3,440.00 30.00 20.00 50.00 2,150.00 39.00 56.00 95.00 4,085.00
24 |opoT cB 2-28 1 EA 4,000.00 2,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00 3,350.00 1,890.00 5,240.00 5,240.00 1,000.00 1,498.00 2,498.00 2,498.00 3,940.00 2,230.00 6,170.00 6,170.00
25 |oDoT HW-2.1 1 EA 1,500.00 2,000.00 3,500.00 3,500.00 1,400.00 1,684.00 3,084.00 3,084.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 1,630.00 2,000.00 3,630.00 3,630.00
26 |RCP, Type B, Without Filter 6 | cy 190.00 40.00 230.00 1,380.00 160.00 46.00 206.00 1,236.00 200.00 100.00 300.00 1,800.00 189.00 54,00 243.00 1,458.00
27 |Gravel Drive 1,075 [ sy 18.00 20.00 38.00 40,850.00 14,00 19.00 33.00 35,475.00 10.00 10.00 20.00 21,500.00 17.00 22,00 39.00 41,925.00
28 |Electrical 1 LS 57,000.00 84,900.00 141,900.00 141,900.00 57,000.00 84,900.00 141,900.00 141,900.00 40,000.00 30,000.00 70,000.00 70,000.00 105,900.00 56,800.00 162,700.00 162,700.00

TOTAL OF ALL SITE & MISCELLANEOUS BID ITEMS

- g 679,926, 625,286.00 420,000.00 272.
(items 1 through 28, inclusive) $ TR AR $ $ $ 690,272.00

* Denotes a contingency item, to be used at the Owner’s Discretion
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BID TABULATION

PROJECT |VILLAGE OF JOHNSTOWN
NAME: ENTERPRISE WATER STORAGE TANK CT PROJECT NO.: 20034507
BID OPG DATE: Friday, March 5, 2021 ENGINEER'S OPINION OF COST: $3,000,000
E " Phoenix Fabricators and Erectors, LLC Caldwell Tanks, Inc. Landmark Structures I, L.P. Mid Atlantic Storage Systems, Inc.
= ITEM DESCRIPTION E | E
o £ TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT
& LABOR MATERIAL PR TOTAL LABOR MATERIAL i TOTAL LABOR MATERIAL s TOTAL LABOR MATERIAL Tol‘:"c‘ém TOTAL
ELEVATED WATER STORAGE TANK BID ITEMS
Elevated C ite Water St Tank -
A1 w::ed St::""s RS SSoreas e 1 Ls 1,400,000.00 [ $ 73827400 [ $ 213827400 | $  2,138,274.00 710,000.00 | $ 1,583,714.00 | $ 2,293714.00 | $ 229371400 | $ 625250.00 | $ 1,875,750.00 | $ 2,501,000.00 | $ 2,501,000.00 $ - NO BID
TOTAL OF ELEVATED WATER STORAGE TANK
BID ITEM A1 L $ 229371400 $ 2,501,000.00 NO BID
Elevated Composite Water Storage Tank —
A2 |5 ited Steel 1 LS - |3 - s - NO BID . - |8 NO BID $ - NO BID $ 1,292,046.00 [ $ 1,155,584.00 | $ 2,447,630.00 2,447,630.00
TOTAL OF ELEVATED WATER STORAGE TANK
BID ITEM A2 et NO BID NO BID 2,447,630.00
A3 |Elevated Fluted Column Water Storage Tank 1 LS - $ - $ - NO BID - - $ NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
TOTAL OF ELEVATED WATER STORAGE TANK
BID ITEM A3 o NO BID NO BID NO BID
A4 |Single Pedestal Elevated Water Storage Tank 1 LS 1,240,000.00 | $ 526,000.00 | $ 1,766,00000 | $  1,766,000.00 560,000.00 [ $ 1,102,214.00 | $ 1,662,214.00 | $ 1,662,214.00 $ . NO BID $ . NO BID
TOTAL OF ELEVATED WATER STORAGE TANK
BID ITEM A4 $ - A.796.09.00 $  1,662,214.00 NO BID NO BID
BID SUMMARY
BID TOTAL: SITE & MISCELLANEOUS BID ITEMS PLUS §  2618:200.00
ELEVATED WATER STORAGE TANK BID ITEM A1 Sathii el $ 2919,000.00 $ 2,921,000.00 NO BID
BID TOTAL: SITE & MISCELLANEOUS BID ITEMS PLUS NO BID
ELEVATED WATER STORAGE TANK BID ITEM A2 T NO BID 3,137,902.00
BID TOTAL: SITE & MISCELLANEOUS BID ITEMS PLUS O B
ELEVATED WATER STORAGE TANK BID ITEM A3 NO BiD NO BID NO BID
BID TOTAL: SITE & MISCELLANEOUS BID ITEMS PLUS SR
ELEVATED WATER STORAGE TANK BID ITEM A4 B RMS928.00 $  2287,500.00 NO BID NO BID

BotoefiMrtns

Baréara R. Anderson, P. E
Ohio Registration No. E- 1 61
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