FRANKLIN STREET WELL PUMP #1 & #2 REPLACEMENT

VILLAGE OF CHAGRIN FALLS
PROJECT NO.: 22025504

BID OPENING DATE: OCTOBER 14, 2022

BID SUMMARY
ALTERNATE BID
BASE BID
Well Pump BASE BID AND
BIDDER Well Pump #1 & #2 #1 & #2 - Pipe ALTERNATE
Replacement
Replacement
Workman Industrial Services, Inc. $101,148.00 $68,966.00 $170,114.00
The Ohio Drilling Company $132,598.00 NO BID NO BID
Moody's of Dayton, Inc. $192,000.00 NO BID NO BID




FRANKLIN STREET WELL PUMP #1 & #2 REPLACEMENT
VILLAGE OF CHAGRIN FALLS
PROJECT NO.: 22025504
BID OPENING DATE: OCTOBER 14, 2022
BID TABULATION - BASE BID

Workman Industrial Services, Inc. The Ohio Drilling Company Moody's of Dayton, Inc.
Ref Description Quan. | Unit | Unit Price | Unit Price | Total Unit Unit Price | Unit Price | Total Unit Unit Price | Unit Price | Total Unit
No. Labor Material Price Item Total Labor Material Price Item Total Labor Material Price Item Total
1 |Well #1 Pump Replacement 1 LUMP | $20,566.00| $30,847.00| $51,413.00| $51,413.00] $41,150.00| $24,824.00( $65,974.00| $65,974.00] $46,000.00| $50,000.00| $96,000.00| $96,000.00
2 |Well #2 Pump Replacement 1 LUMP | $19,894.00| $29,841.00| $49,735.00| $49,735.00] $40,800.00| $25,824.00( $66,624.00| $66,624.00] $46,000.00| $50,000.00| $96,000.00| $96,000.00
$101,148.00 $132,598.00 $192,000.00|

Total Bid Amount - Base Bid




FRANKLIN STREET WELL PUMP #1 & #2 REPLACEMENT
VILLAGE OF CHAGRIN FALLS
PROJECT NO.: 22025504
BID OPENING DATE: OCTOBER 14, 2022
BID TABULATION - ALTERNATE

Workman Industrial Services, Inc. The Ohio Drilling Company Moody's of Dayton, Inc.
Ref Description Quan.| Unit | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | Total Unit Unit Price | Unit Price | Total Unit Unit Price | Unit Price | Total Unit
No. Labor Material Price Item Total Labor Material Price Item Total Labor Material Price Item Total
1 |Well #1 Pipe Replacement 1 LUMP | $14,353.00( $20,505.00( $34,858.00| $34,858.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2 |Well #2 Pipe Replacement 1 LUMP | $14,325.00( $19,783.00( $34,108.00| $34,108.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Bid Amount - Alternate Bid $68,966.00 No Bid No Bid




