
PROJECT:

OWNER:

PROJECT NO.: 190228

SORTED BY BASE BID

BIDDER BASE BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE &

BID  ALT A1 ALT A2  ALT A3 ALT A4  ALT A1 & A2 ALT A1 & A3  ALT A1 & A4 ALT A2 & A3  ALT A2 & A4 ALT A3 & A4  ALT A1, A2 & A3 ALT A1, A2 & A4 ALT A1, A3 & A4  ALT A2, A3 & A4 ALT A1, 2, 3 & 4

ABC PIPING, CO. $8,620,000.00 $8,956,000.00 $9,015,000.00 $9,189,000.00 $8,685,000.00 $9,351,000.00 $9,525,000.00 $9,021,000.00 $9,584,000.00 $9,080,000.00 $9,254,000.00 $9,920,000.00 $9,416,000.00 $9,590,000.00 $9,649,000.00 $9,985,000.00

UNION INDUSTRIAL CONTRACTORS, INC. $8,845,000.00 $9,128,500.00 $9,281,000.00 $9,582,000.00 $8,893,500.00 $9,564,500.00 $9,865,500.00 $9,177,000.00 $10,018,000.00 $9,329,500.00 $9,630,500.00 $10,301,500.00 $9,613,000.00 $9,914,000.00 $10,066,500.00 $10,350,000.00

ALTERNATES ALT A1 ALT A2 ALT A3 ALT 4

Sludge 

Dewatering 

Press & Cake 

Auger

Sludge 

Dewatering 

Press 

Associated 

Work & Sludge 

Dump Pad

New Sludge 

Storage Tank

Canopy Side 

Wall 

Sheathing for 

Two Canopies

ABC PIPING, CO. $336,000.00 $395,000.00 $569,000.00 $65,000.00

UNION INDUSTRIAL CONTRACTORS, INC. $283,500.00 $436,000.00 $737,000.00 $48,500.00

COFFEE CREEK WWTP EXPANSION

ASHTABULA COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS



COFFEE CREEK WWTP EXPANSION
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PROJECT: 190228

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 18, 2024

BID TABULATION

ABC Piping, Co. Union Industrial Contractors, Inc.

Ref 

No.
Description Quan. Unit Unit Price 

Labor

Unit Price 

Material Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Labor

Unit Price 

Material Total Unit Price Item Total

1 General Trades 1 LS $3,920,000.00 $4,700,000.00 $8,620,000.00 $8,620,000.00 $2,895,000.00 $5,950,000.00 $8,845,000.00 $8,845,000.00

A1. Sludge Dewatering Press & Cake Auger 1 LS $36,000.00 $300,000.00 $336,000.00 $336,000.00 $18,500.00 $265,000.00 $283,500.00 $283,500.00

A2. Sludge Dewatering Press Associated Work & Sludge Dump Pad 1 LS $195,000.00 $200,000.00 $395,000.00 $395,000.00 $74,000.00 $362,000.00 $436,000.00 $436,000.00

A3. New Sludge Storage Tank 1 LS $209,000.00 $360,000.00 $569,000.00 $569,000.00 $52,000.00 $685,000.00 $737,000.00 $737,000.00

A4. Canopy Side Wall Sheathing for Two Canopies 1 LS $30,000.00 $35,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $34,000.00 $14,500.00 $48,500.00 $48,500.00

A5. Equipment Change 1 1 LS No Bid No Bid

A6. Equipment Change 2 1 LS No Bid No Bid

A7. Equipment Change 3 1 LS No Bid No Bid




