

STATE ROUTE 133 - SANITARY PUMP STATION

VILLAGE OF WILLIAMSBURG

PROJECT NO. 201011

SORTED BY BASE BID BIDDER	BASE	BASE &	BASE &	BASE &	BASE &	BASE &	BASE &
	BID	ALT A	ALT B	ALT C	ALT A&D	ALT B&D	ALT C&D
Stauffer Site Services LLC	\$202,350.00	\$328,350.00	\$328,350.00	\$322,350.00	\$325,350.00	\$325,350.00	\$319,350.00
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$246,000.00	\$411,000.00	\$406,000.00	\$406,000.00	\$405,000.00	\$400,000.00	\$400,000.00
Ford Development Corp.	\$260,040.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$366,040.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$378,040.00

ALTERNATES	ALT A	ALT B	ALT C	ALT D
	Lift Station Concrete Excel	Lift Station Concrete Sulzer	Lift Station Concrete Ebara	Lift Station Add/Deduct Fiberglass
Stauffer Site Services LLC	\$126,000.00	\$126,000.00	\$120,000.00	(\$3,000.00)
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$165,000.00	\$160,000.00	\$160,000.00	(\$6,000.00)
Ford Development Corp.	No Bid	No Bid	\$106,000.00	\$12,000.00

State Route 133 – Sanitary Pump Station
Village of Williamsburg
Bid Opening Date: April 08, 2021
Bid Tabulation Summary
Base Bid - All work except Lift Station
Project No. 201011

LIST OF BIDDERS

BIDDER

- 1 Stauffer Site Services, LLC
3630 Middleboro Road
Morrow, OH 45152
Phone number: (513) 678-9168

- 2 Sunesis Construction Co.
2610 Cresentville Road
West Chester, OH 45069
Phone number: (513) 326-6000

- 3 Ford Development
11148 Woodward Lane
Cincinnati, OH 45236
Phone number: (513) 772-1537

State Route 133 – Sanitary Pump Station
Village of Williamsburg
Bid Opening Date: April 08, 2021
Bid Tabulation Summary
Base Bid - All work except Lift Station
Project No. 201011

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$202,350.00	
2.	Sunesis Construction Co.	\$246,000.00	
3.	Ford Development	\$260,040.00	

State Route 133 – Sanitary Pump Station
 Village of Williamsburg
 Bid Opening Date: April 08, 2021
 Bid Tabulation Summary
 Base Bid - All work except Lift Station
 Project No. 201011

LIST OF ALL ITEMS

NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidders	Labor	Material	Calculated Unit Price	Bidder's Informal Unit Price	Calculated Line Item Total	Bidder's Informal Line Item Total
1. 50.00 SY OF (SPC) PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT, AS PER PLAN						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$100.00		\$5,000.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$100.00	\$55.00	\$155.00		\$7,750.00	
Ford Development	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$40.00		\$2,000.00	
2. 95.00 SY OF (SPC) GRAVEL ACCESS DRIVE, AS PER PLAN						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$20.00		\$1,900.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$20.00	\$25.00	\$45.00		\$4,275.00	
Ford Development	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$10.00		\$950.00	
3. 323.00 FT OF (611) 8" SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$70.00	\$25.00	\$95.00		\$30,685.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$60.00	\$58.00	\$118.00		\$38,114.00	
Ford Development	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$300.00		\$96,900.00	
4. 289.00 FT OF (611) 12" SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$155.00	\$35.00	\$190.00		\$54,910.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$80.00	\$79.00	\$159.00		\$45,951.00	
Ford Development	\$160.00	\$160.00	\$320.00		\$92,480.00	
5. 710.00 FT OF (611) 6 INCH CONDUIT, HORIZONTAL DIRECTIONAL DRILLING WITHOUT CASING, AS PER PLAN						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$55.00	\$15.00	\$70.00		\$49,700.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$44.00	\$22.00	\$66.00		\$46,860.00	
Ford Development	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$24.00		\$17,040.00	
6. 3.00 EACH OF (611) TYPE "A" SANITARY MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$2,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$4,000.00		\$12,000.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$4,000.00	\$2,280.00	\$6,280.00		\$18,840.00	
Ford Development	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$5,000.00		\$15,000.00	
7. 1.00 EACH OF (611) MANHOLE, MISC.: CONNECTION TO EXISTING MANHOLE						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$1,500.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00		\$2,500.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$2,000.00	\$400.00	\$2,400.00		\$2,400.00	
Ford Development	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$1,000.00		\$1,000.00	

State Route 133 – Sanitary Pump Station
 Village of Williamsburg
 Bid Opening Date: April 08, 2021
 Bid Tabulation Summary
 Base Bid - All work except Lift Station
 Project No. 201011

LIST OF ALL ITEMS
NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidders	Labor	Material	Calculated Unit Price	Bidder's Informal Unit Price	Calculated Line Item Total	Bidder's Informal Line Item Total
8. 1.00 LS OF (614) MAINTAINING TRAFFIC, AS PER PLAN						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$3,500.00	\$0.00	\$3,500.00		\$3,500.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$8,000.00	\$1,500.00	\$9,500.00		\$9,500.00	
Ford Development	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$500.00		\$500.00	
9. 1.00 LS OF (623) CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT STAKES AND SURVEYING						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$3,500.00	\$0.00	\$3,500.00		\$3,500.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$2,500.00	\$300.00	\$2,800.00		\$2,800.00	
Ford Development	\$5,000.00	\$0.00	\$5,000.00		\$5,000.00	
10. 1.00 LS OF (624) MOBILIZATION						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$7,500.00	\$0.00	\$7,500.00		\$7,500.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$30,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$40,000.00		\$40,000.00	
Ford Development	\$10,000.00	\$0.00	\$10,000.00		\$10,000.00	
11. 1,750.00 SY OF (659) SEEDING AND MULCHING						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$4.00	\$1.00	\$5.00		\$8,750.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$2.00		\$3,500.00	
Ford Development	\$0.50	\$0.50	\$1.00		\$1,750.00	
12. 45.00 FT OF (680) 2 INCH FORCE MAIN, AS PER PLAN						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$34.00	\$5.00	\$39.00		\$1,755.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$38.00	\$20.00	\$58.00		\$2,610.00	
Ford Development	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$20.00		\$900.00	
13. 710.00 FT OF (680) 2 INCH FORCE MAIN SLEEVED INSIDE PROPOSED CASING PIPE, AS PER PLAN						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$10.00	\$5.00	\$15.00		\$10,650.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$20.00		\$14,200.00	
Ford Development	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$12.00		\$8,520.00	
14. 1.00 LS OF (832) STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$2,500.00	\$0.00	\$2,500.00		\$2,500.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$1,300.00	\$400.00	\$1,700.00		\$1,700.00	
Ford Development	\$500.00	\$0.00	\$500.00		\$500.00	

State Route 133 – Sanitary Pump Station
 Village of Williamsburg
 Bid Opening Date: April 08, 2021
 Bid Tabulation Summary
 Base Bid - All work except Lift Station
 Project No. 201011

LIST OF ALL ITEMS

NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

<u>Bidders</u>	<u>Labor</u>	<u>Material</u>	<u>Calculated Unit Price</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Unit Price</u>	<u>Calculated Line Item Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Line Item Total</u>
15. 7,500.00 EACH OF (832) EROSION CONTROL						
Stauffer Site Services, LLC	\$0.00	\$1.00	\$1.00		\$7,500.00	
Sunesis Construction Co.	\$0.00	\$1.00	\$1.00		\$7,500.00	
Ford Development	\$0.00	\$1.00	\$1.00		\$7,500.00	

STATE ROUTE 133 - SANITARY PUMP STATION
VILLAGE OF WILLIAMSBURG
PROJECT NO.: 201011
BID OPENING DATE: APRIL 8, 2021
BID TABULATION

Ref No.	Description	Quan.	Unit	Stauffer Site Services, LLC			Sunesis Construction Co.			Ford Development Corp.						
				Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	
A	LIFT STATION - CONCRETE - ALTERNATE A - EXCEL FLUID GROUP	1	EA	\$66,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$126,000.00	\$126,000.00	\$55,000.00	\$110,000.00	\$165,000.00	\$165,000.00					No Bid
B	LIFT STATION - CONCRETE - ALTERNATE B - SULZER	1	EA	\$66,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$126,000.00	\$126,000.00	\$55,000.00	\$105,000.00	\$160,000.00	\$160,000.00					No Bid
C	LIFT STATION - CONCRETE - ALTERNATE C - EBARA	1	EA	\$60,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$120,000.00	\$120,000.00	\$55,000.00	\$105,000.00	\$160,000.00	\$160,000.00	\$53,000.00	\$53,000.00	\$106,000.00	\$106,000.00	
D	LIFT STATION - ADD/DEDUCT FOR FIBERGLASS STRUCTURE IN LIEU OF A CONCRETE STRUCTURE	1	EA	\$0.00	(\$3,000.00)	(\$3,000.00)	(\$3,000.00)	(\$2,000.00)	(\$4,000.00)	(\$6,000.00)	(\$6,000.00)	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	