
PROJECT: Maple Street Improvements Phase 1 - Miles/Solon Road to Church Street

OWNER: Village of Chagrin Falls

PROJECT NO.: 22025502

SORTED BY BASE BID

BIDDER BASE BASE & BASE & BASE & BASE &

BID  ALT 1A ALT 1B  ALT 1C ALT 1D

Fabrizi Trucking & Paving Co. $1,796,029.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Trax Construction Co. $1,879,355.00 $1,879,355.00 $1,884,855.00 $1,892,555.00 $1,897,835.00

Eclipse Co., LLC $2,114,148.00 $2,184,148.00 $2,192,148.00 $2,214,148.00 No Bid

S.E.T., Inc. $2,128,289.06 $2,218,289.06 $2,248,289.06 $2,263,289.06 No Bid

ADD ALTERNATES Base Bid ALT 1A ALT 1B ALT 1C ALT 1D ALT 1D

for EARLY COMPLETION August 9, 2024 July 12, 2024 June 28, 2024 June 7, 2024

Contractor 

Proposed Date

Fabrizi Trucking & Paving Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Trax Construction Co. $0.00 $5,500.00 $13,200.00 $18,480.00 May 31, 2024

Eclipse Co., LLC $70,000.00 $78,000.00 $100,000.00 No Bid

S.E.T., Inc. $90,000.00 $120,000.00 $135,000.00 No Bid



Maple Street Improvements
Village of Chagrin Falls

Bid Opening Date: December 15, 2023
Bid Tabulation Summary

Phase 1 - Miles/Solon Road to Church Street
Project No. 22025502

LIST OF BIDDERS
BIDDER

Fabrizi Trucking & Paving Co., Inc.1
20389 First Avenue

Phone number: (440) 973-4929
Middleburg Hts., OH 44130

Trax Construction Co.2
30701 Euclid Avenue

Phone number: (440) 585-1439
Wickliffe, OH 44092

Eclipse Co., LLC3
11554 East Washington

Phone number: (440) 543-3493
Chagrin Falls, OH 44023

S.E.T. Inc.4
235 East Water Street, Suite C

Phone number: (330) 536-6724
Lowellville, OH 444361273

Page   1December 22, 2023



Maple Street Improvements
Village of Chagrin Falls

Bid Opening Date: December 15, 2023
Bid Tabulation Summary

Phase 1 - Miles/Solon Road to Church Street
Project No. 22025502

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Name Calculated Total
Bidder's

Informal Totals

Fabrizi Trucking & Paving Co., Inc. $1,796,029.50 $1,796,029.00  1.
Trax Construction Co. $1,879,355.00  2.
Eclipse Co., LLC $2,114,148.00  3.
S.E.T. Inc. $2,128,289.06 $2,117,489.00  4.
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